
Health and Social Care - KS5 overview 

Year Autumn 1 Autumn 2 Spring 1 Spring 2 Summer 1 Summer 2 

Year 12 

Unit 1 – Human 
Lifespan Development  
 
Physical, intellectual 
and emotional 
development through 
the life stages. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Unit 14 Physiological 
Disorders and Their 
Care 
 
Learning Aim A:  
Investigate the causes 
and effects of 
physiological disorders. 
 
 
 

Unit 1 – Human 
Lifespan Development 
Learning 
 
Social development 
through the life stages 
and nature vs nurture.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Unit 14 Physiological 
Disorders and Their 
Care 
 
Learning Aim B: 
Investigate the causes 
and effects of 
physiological disorders 
 
 
 

Unit 1 – Human Lifespan 
Development  
 
Genetic, environmental 
and social factors that 
can impact development. 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Unit 14 Physiological 
Disorders and Their Care 
 
 
Learning Aim C:  
Examine the investigation 
and diagnosis of 
physiological disorders  
 
 
 
 

Unit 2 – Working in 
Health and Social Care 
Settings  
 
Economic factors that can 
impact development and 
how major life events can 
impact development.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
Unit 14 Physiological 
Disorders and Their Care 
 
 
Learning Aim D:  
Examine treatment and 
support for service users 
with physiological 
disorders. 
 
 
 
 

Unit 1 – Human 
Lifespan Development 
Revision and Unit 1 
exam. 
 
Unit 2 – Working in 
Health and Social Care 
Settings  
 
Roles of people that 
work in health and 
social care settings. 
 
 
Unit 5 - Meeting 
Individual Care and 
Support Needs 
 
Learning Aim A: 
Examine principles, 
values and skills which 
underpin meeting the 
care and support 
needs of individuals  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Unit 2 – Working in 
Health and Social Care 
Settings  
 
Responsibilities of people 
who work in health and 
social care settings, the 
role of a multi-
disciplinary team and 
how staff are monitored 
in a health and social care 
setting.  
 
 
Unit 5 - Meeting 
Individual Care and 
Support Needs 
 
Learning Aim A:  
Examine the ethical 
issues involved when 
providing care and 
support to meet 
individual needs. 
 



 

Year Autumn 1 Autumn 2 Spring 1 Spring 2 Summer 1 Summer 2 

Year 13 

Unit 2 – Working in 
Health and Social Care 
Settings Types of 
sectors and settings in 
health and social care, 
representing service 
users and regulation 
and inspection of 
settings.  
 
 
 
 
 
Unit 5 - Meeting 
Individual Care and 
Support Needs 
 
 
Learning Aim B: 
Investigate the 
principles behind 
enabling individuals 
with care and support 
needs to overcome 
challenges. 
 
 
 

Unit 2 – Working in 
Health and Social Care 
Settings 
Responsibilities of 
organisations to their 
employees, revision 
and exam skill 
practice.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
Unit 5 - Meeting 
Individual Care and 
Support Needs 
 
 
Learning Aim B: 
Investigate the roles of 
professionals and how 
they work together to 
provide the care and 
support necessary to 
meet individual needs. 
 
 

Unit 2 – Working in 
Health and Social Care 
settings January Unit 2 
exam preparation and 
revision 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Unit 5 - Meeting 
Individual Care and 
Support Needs 
 
 
Learning Aim C: 
Investigate the roles of 
professionals and how 
they work together to 
provide the care and 
support necessary to 
meet individual needs. 
 
 
 

Unit 1 – Human 
lifespan development  
Resit preparation. 
Revision and exam skill 
practice. 
 
 
Unit 2 – Working in 
Health and Social Care 
settings Preparation and 
revision. Exam skill 
practice.  

 
Unit 5 - Meeting 
Individual Care and 
Support Needs 
 
 
Learning Aim D: 
Investigate the roles of 
professionals and how 
they work together to 
provide the care and 
support necessary to 
meet individual needs. 
 

Unit 1 – Human 
lifespan 
development Resit 
preparation. 
Revision and exam 
skill practice. 
 
Unit 2 – Working in 
Health and Social Care 
settings  
Preparation and 
revision. Exam skill 
practice.  
 
 

Students on exam leave 
 


